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Dian Anita NUSWANTARA <diananita@unesa.ac.id>

Re: Congratulations!!!
1 message

The IJBM Business & Management Journal <publication@theijom.com> Tue, Dec 24, 2019 at 4:59 PM
To: dian.a.nuswantara.unesa@gmail.com, diananita@unesa.ac.id

Dear Sir/Madam,

Greetings!!!

Thanks for communicating with us.

1. Please find the attached formal aaceptance letter of your paper.

2. Based on your request, we can provide you maximum 10% discount on the publication fee. So you need to pay
$63(excluding transaction charges) as the publication fee for the one paper. Please find the attached the updated
invoice.

Feel free to mail us for any further clarification. We will be happy to respond to your query.

To a joyful present and a well-remembered past. Best wishes for Happy Holidays and a magnificent New
Year!

Don't forget to check the reviews of our authors in the below mentioned link :
https://www.facebook.com/internationaljournalcorner/reviews/

Thank You...

With Regards,

|. Banerjee

Department of Publication

The International Journal of Business & Management

ISSN 2321 8916
http://www.internationaljournalcorner.com/index.php/theijbm

On Mon, 23 Dec 2019 at 19:23, dian anitanuswantara <dian.a.nuswantara.unesa@gmail.com> wrote:
Dear editorial team

Thank you for your decision | am happy. Can | get discount for publication fee?. This research did not received
financial support, can | pay a half of it please?, If yes, could you please give me new invoice with new number
for publication fee?. Then put information detail of my accepted manuscript in that letter with my official

email address (diananita@unesa.ac.id).

Again please consider my request. | really want to publish it in your journal but i dont have 70 dollars. if i receive
new invoice i will pay it tomorrow.

again thank you very much

best regard
Dian

On Mon, Dec 23, 2019 at 11:48 AM The IJBM Business & Management Journal <publication@theijom.com>
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wrote:
Dear Sir/Madam,

Greetings!!!

We are happy to inform you that after a rigorous review process, our review panel has reached a decision
about your paper!

Your paper titled "TAXPAYERS BEHAVIOUR; HOMO ECONOMICUS AS A RATIONAL MAXIMISER OF
SELF-INTEREST: EVIDENCE FROM SMEs IN INDONESIA" (BM1912-044) has been accepted for
publication in the ‘December Issue, 2019’ (Vol 7 Issue 12) of “The IJBM”. Please deposit your publication
fee for further process of your paper.

Details of Publication Fee:
1. Amount: $70 (excluding transaction charges)

2. Publication Fee Includes: Paper Publication charge, DOI from Crossref, Official Review Report, Digital
Certificate, Life Time Archive of the Paper

3. Due Date: 26th December, 2019

4. Payment Modes:

* By PayPal

Author can deposit fee by net banking/credit card/debit card (visa card/master card) as follows online
process. Please inform us if you want to avail this option. We will send you the PayPal payment
invoice through which you need to pay the fee.

* By Bank Deposit

Author can deposit fee directly in the provided bank account details by visiting to a nearby branch of any
bank. For this, author can refer to the attached "Instruction of Payment”. We Suggest, please take a printout
of the ‘Instruction of Payment’ document and submit to your bank/agent for the payment.

* By Internet Banking
Author can also use this way to deposit fee as stated in the attached "Instruction of Payment" by activating the
internet banking facility in their bank account.

*Swift/Telex Transfer Payment
Authors from all countries where Pay Pal does not work can use Swift/Telex transfer. For this author can use
the attached "Instruction of Payment".

5. After payment, please send the payment details (hame, transaction id, account no etc.)
to publication@theijbm.com . In case of bank deposit, please collect the swift message of the
transaction from the bank and send us.

Mention your manuscript ID for further communications & kindly acknowledge the receipt of this mail.

Now get DOI for your publication with ThelJBM! ThelJBM joined hands with Crossref to provide DOI
for every published paper. There are no extra charges for DOI. Don't miss this fair opportunity.

Feel free to mail us for any further clarification. We will be happy to respond to your query.

Don't forget to check the reviews of our authors in the below mentioned link :
https://www.facebook.com/internationaljournalcorner/reviews/

Thank You...

With Regards,

I. Banerjee

Department of Publication

The International Journal of Business & Management
ISSN 2321 8916

https://mail.google.com/mail/u/0/?ik=daeed479d27&view=pt&sear...ad-f%3A1653794787978074847&simpl=msg-f%3A1653794787978074847 Page 2 of 3


mailto:publication@theijbm.com
https://www.facebook.com/internationaljournalcorner/reviews/

Universitas Negeri Surabaya Mail - Re: Congratulations!!! 15/11/22 15.31

http://www.internationaljournalcorner.com/index.php/theijom

2 attachments

@ Latest Instruction of Payment_ThelJBM_$63.docx
23K

@ Formal letter of acceptance_BM1912-044.pdf
45K
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